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Elites Are Elite—In Name Only 

My good friend, John, who in his 90's (to whom I owe much of who I am as a man), is 
running for school board in SoCal. He texted: Why r u so hard on the elites?   Should 
they not be in leadership roles? This question needs taken seriously—and head-on.

After one of my articles, John responded to my criticism of Janet Yellen, if I remem-
ber correctly, as a kind, intelligent woman. Well I just cannot abide that. To my mind, 
Janet likely back-bites with the best of them. Her economic acumen is not worthy of 
gracing the back of a bar napkin and her recent trip to China where she went a-beg-
ging for favors while admonishing China for overproduction—was way over the top.

Janet Yellen may be a nice woman when compared to some in a pack of hyenas that 
make up the elite. Who get included in that pack? Anyone with influence and power 
over our political and economic lives. With a further caveat—those who, from utter stu-
pidity, or having crossed the line into evil, no longer need to be referred to as human.

In that crowd I include names in the news who are recognized as having funding re-
sponsibility for the breakdown of civility/civilization in Seattle/Portland, etc.—funders of 
piles of bricks for BLM/Antifa, police-defunding, and mass illegal migration into the US.

While not attaching any names directly for each crime, I suspect funding for things 
outside the bounds of human decency and support for the abolishment of the US Con-
stitution/Bill of Rights, comes from the money spigots of major foundations: Gates, 
Clinton, Soros, etcetera. These people I see as responsible for our circus of horrors.

And most of the deluded left: Hollywood personalities and rich funders who often live 
in Las Vegas—who are among wealthy Jews that fund the takeover/takedown of our 
beloved republic, as a gift to Israel in its quest for Zionist world dominion. And to many 
Jewish pundits, while getting most of it right, bend a knee to kiss the ring of Zionism.

Let's consider one person from the hyena pack, Yuval Harari, who passes himself off 
as a philosopher. As something of an etymologist, I return to the root of the word—phi-
losophy—love of wisdom. Philosophy, as it applies to humans, sorts to a single issue.

In the 1st Book of Republic (Plato), Socrates takes up the issue of justice. What is 
justice? Is justice the will of elites—or is it something else? For the elite, advantage of 
the stronger is the currency of economics/politics. Where Mao was going with political 
power coming out of the barrel of a gun, that's what elites do—they inflict their justice.

To make a long story short, by Book 10 of the Republic, justice gets its definition—



minding one's own business—the truest, simple rendering of justice in the history of 
mankind. To insure Americans their own business, the founders created a Bill of Rights.

So, here we go again—back into Republic, Book 1—with your host—Yuval Harari. 
Just what is it that Yuval is trying to tell us with his Ted Talks? That AI is something he 
understands and we do not—the coming of a new technological religion. The fusion of  
AI technology with human beings, that will give certain elitist groups the power of gods.

Simply put, this is might is right, all dressed up in new threads (actually vestments—
I'd forgotten these are gods), but with the same tiresome, historical soap opera, in-
tended to strip-away intrinsic rights—giving-over political/economic control to elites. 

This rates a Ted Talk? Maybe a Ted Bundy—talk. Harari's plan is to have us simple 
folk pitched-to by the techno-tyranny resulting in a 1-tricked pony—ending our rebel-
lion/returning to centralized order/control. Freedom/individuality—just another fantasy. 

In this rebellion, nationalism alone can't save us because nationalists, lacking over-
view, don't realize that the tactic of Harari, et al, is to create the appearance of political 
parties in strife, when in reality—they are not. Where it matters, they function as a uni-
party—building blocks in the creation of a mass surveillance state—economic tyranny.   

Harari sends his message that war is coming unless nationalism is abandoned as a 
threat to globalism (for which Trump is the great threat). That elites, coupled with AI, 
have made it possible for a chosen few to make a transition from animals into gods.    

Digital authoritarianism is the newest rendition for a control they've been selling for 
millennia, with AI added as the kicker. But the Harari crowd did not create AI. It was Eli 
Whitney, Gutenberg, Jobs, and a host of others credited with technology advancement.

The Schwab/Harari mob are only the latest in a long line of tyrants subjecting peas-
ants—using fear. Ed Landing would walk by my cubicle, in Sicily, 1964, each morning, 
with a new denunciation of authoritarianism: "Morning Whip—here's your plan of the 
day. Before this is over they're just another stream of rats running down the guy-lines— 
abandoning ship. Those secret ceremonies, initiations they use to control—ain't shit."     

Harari informs all will be well once we abandon lies we hold dear about personal in-
dividualism/independence. The elite and AI will set things right. Harari, being the gossip 
of globalism that he is, can't keep his mouth shut. If you want to know what the elites 
have in store for us, listen to his past talks. It's all there—offered-up as roadmap to hell.  

To take control, Elites need to end our freedom of movement—to be accomplished 
with vaccine passports. Imagine the consternation among them now, with so many re-
belling against their authority. Never forget what they had planned for us with the 'vac-
cines'/rest in place, fears When that didn't work out for them—it threw them into panic.  

Now, they are each/all singing a different tune. Nationalism is no longer the enemy of 
globalism—we all work together—until a new pandemic lie can be foisted on us, taking 
us right back to mission central. For now, Tedros, Harari, and Gates smile while biding 
their time. With the vax fail, Schwab and Fauci, like Biden, are too old to bide any time.

The discussion cannot be completed without laying-out elite plans for money—which 
are not what most of us think. Nevertheless, they have to get control of the money. The 
plan they have is in process, with few of our leaders outside of the mission. Next time.

I'll end with a reminder to my friend John, a caring outsider who worked within the 
system. The John I knew would no longer be tolerated. And, shout-out to Tom Luongo's 
love of comics/Star Wars, pitting freedom against tyranny. May the Force be with you!

Get my articles by email with a request: erik@neverhadaboss.com. And, thank you.  


